

2018-2019 Musical Instrument Bid
Bid Opening 06.12.18

| <u>Item</u> | <u>Quantity</u> | <u>Instrument</u> | <u>Shar Products</u> | <u>System Blue</u> | <u>Washington Music</u> |
|-------------------|-----------------|--|----------------------|---|-------------------------|
| 1 | 1 | Yamaha YTS-480 Intermediate Bb Tenor Saxophone Lacquer | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 1,900.75 |
| 2 | 1 | Franz Hoffman Amadeus String Bass Outfit (PB-100T) (1/2 Size)-bag, bow, & rosin | \$1,149.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 3 | 1 | Franz Hoffman Danube Cello Outfit (HEC200S1) (4/4 Size)-bag, bow, & rosin | \$1,099.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 4 | 1 | Franz Hoffman Danube Cello Outfit (HEC200S1) (3/4 Size)-bag, bow, & rosin | \$1,099.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 5 | 1 | Franz Hoffman Concert Bass Outfit (3/4 Size)-Presto Carbon Fiber French bow & Carlsson rosin | \$1,999.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 6 | 1 | Franz Hoffman Amadeus Cello Outfit (HC100T) (3/4 Size)-bag, bow, & rosin | \$ 779.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| 7 | 1 | King (1135W) (3/4 size) BBb Tuba-Lacquer | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 3,181.92 |
| 8 | 3 | Carbon Fiber-System Blue-Hi-Tension Snare 14" (Phatboy-PVC) | No Bid | \$700.00 each; \$2,100.00 total | No Bid |
| 9 | 2 | Carbon Fiber Hi-Tension Hex Set (Tenor-PVC) | No Bid | \$1,500.00 each; \$3,000.00 total | No Bid |
| 10 | 1 | Carbon Fiber Bass Drum-16" (SBN-MBD16)-System Blue | No Bid | \$ 470.00 | No Bid |
| 11 | 1 | Carbon Fiber Bass Drum-18" (SBN-MBD18)-System Blue | No Bid | \$ 510.00 | No Bid |
| 12 | 1 | Carbon Fiber Bass Drum-20" (SBN-MBD20)-System Blue | No Bid | \$ 570.00 | No Bid |
| 13 | 1 | Carbon Fiber Bass Drum-22" (SBN-MBD22)-System Blue | No Bid | \$ 590.00 | No Bid |
| 14 | 1 | Carbon Fiber Bass Drum-24" (SBN-MBD24)-System Blue | No Bid | \$ 640.00 | No Bid |
| 15 | 4 | Marching F Mellophone-Silver Plated 10.5" Bell (SB20S-LE) | No Bid | \$1,100.00 each; \$4,400.00 total | No Bid |
| Total Bids | | | \$6,125.00 | \$ 12,280.00 | \$ 5,082.67 |