

**2018 MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS AND EQUIPMENT BID  
BID TALLY SHEET**

<u>Item</u>	<u>Menchey Music</u> (SEE BID FOR FULL DESCRIPTION BID)	<u>Nick Rail Music</u>	<u>Sam Ash Music</u>	<u>Shar</u>	<u>Taylor Music</u>	<u>Washington Music Center</u>
Buffet Crampon E12F Bb Clarinet	BC2512F-2-0 \$1,191.00	BC2512F-2-0 \$1,035.00	\$945.00	NO BID	\$949.00	\$987.00
Pearl Alto Flute 201 Series w/Curved & Straight Head J PFA201SU	#PFA201SU \$1,241.00	\$1,115.00	\$1,069.00	NO BID	PFA 201SU = \$1044.00 PFA 201ESU = \$1077.00	PFA 201SU \$1,063.00
Pearl Bass Flute 305 Series w/B Foot; Splite E; & Crutch	PFB305BE \$2,589.00	#PFB305BE \$2,330.00	PFB 305BE \$2,215.00	NO BID	PFB305BE \$2,177.00	PFB305BE \$2,217.00
King 1135W BBb Tuba-3/4 Size	1135H \$3,823.00	ALT: EASTMAN #EBB234 \$2,195.00	\$3,235.00	NO BID	\$3,199.00	\$3,182.00
Franz Hoffman Amadeus Bass Outfit - 1/2 Size w/French Bow	NO BID	ALT: EASTMAN #VB80ST-1/2 \$1,295.00	NO BID	\$1,224.00	NO BID	NO BID
Franz Hoffman Amadeus Cello Outfit - 3/4 Size	ALT: Gunther Loewe Fully Curved Cello \$846.00	ALT: EASTMAN #VC80ST-3/4 \$595.00	NO BID	CARVED HC1005134 \$779.00	NO BID	NO BID
Franz Hoffmann Concert Bass Outfit - 3/4 Size w/Presto Carbon Fiber French Bow & Carlsson Rosin	ALT: Shen SB150 Hybrid Bass Curved Top \$2,279.00	ALT: EASTMAN #VB105ST-3/4 \$2,395.00	NO BID	\$2,074.00	NO BID	NO BID
Franz Hoffmann Danube Cello - 4/4 Size with Bow, Bag, & Rosin	ALT: Samuel Shen Fuller Carved Model 200 Ma \$1,171.00	ALT: EASTMAN #VC200ST-4 \$1,020.00	NO BID	\$1,099.00	NO BID	NO BID
Franz Hoffmann Danube Cello - 3/4 Size with Bow, Bag, & Rosin	ALT: Samuel Shen Fuller Carved Model 200 Ma \$1,171.00	EASTMAN #VC200ST-3/4 \$1,020.00	NO BID	\$1,099.00	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTAL BID</b>	<b>\$14,311.00</b>	<b>\$13,000.00</b>	<b>\$7,464.00</b>	<b>\$6,275.00</b>	<b>\$7,369.00 TO \$7,402.00</b>	<b>\$7,449.00</b>

**AWARDED BID**